BID TABULATION & NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

Buyer: Brittany Craven
Buyer Phone: 352-629-8544

e ProRFx ID: RFQ02022400000018

5
%- Notifications Sent: 223

OPTIONAL LINE ITEMS- Not included in Total Bid Amount

Exterior / Interior Elevated Window Cleaning

Bids: 15 Email heraven@acalafl aow
05/13/2024 Notice of Intent to Award to Serviamigos Solutions, LLC pending City Council approval.
RFQ# AIR/240384 - Janitorial Services - Airport Mildiean|UsAY | serviemiges B || American Facility! || Southern|Cleaning [ American’ [ Outiiers Capriall || [ rE o2 IO e o Renzlaul [ Attentiom o N o rere) | Heavenly Touch [ vise Cuys T First Coast | DGA Cleaning
. N N L Cleaning Detail Executive N Cleaning Maintenance L N
LLC Solutions, LLC Services, Inc. Services, Inc. Janitorial, Inc. SMB, LLC . Lee Co., Inc. N . Inc. Cleaning, LLC . Franchising, LLC Services, LLC
LLC Cleanina Services. Groun_LLC
Orlando, FL Ocala, FL Apharetta, GA Jacksonville, FL Umatilla, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Orlando, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL [Vest Palm Beach, F| Jacksonville, FL | Jacksonville, FL
1 | Airport Terminal (excluding Airport Admin) ;:g‘Oa.m.-m:oo szys"e'swe:k $ 37521 | s 558.00 | $ 54600 | § 59500 | § 55385 | § 64950 | § 550,00 | § 82298 | § 63000 | § 75000 | $ 72500 | § 78000 | § 142188 | § 245100 | § 5,480.00
-m. londay — Sunday
2 |Air Traffic Control Tower 9:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 1"3{:";"”*“ $ 3000 | $ 33.00 | § 3675 | $ 50.00 | $ 5538 | § 51.00 | $ 5500 | $ 1438 | § 7500 | $ 60.00 | $ 10000 | $ 100,00 | § 10157 | § 14575 | $ 1,300.00
riday
1 day per week
3 |Hangar 19 9:00am. ~5:00pm. & E5 $ 3000 | s 3500 | § 49.00 | § 3000 | § 7449 | § 51.00 | § 55.00 | § 1438 | § 7500 | § 55.00 | § 7500 | § 80.00 | § 10157 | § 21997 | § 1,300.00
inesday
B - " 1 day per week
4 |Airport Administration 7:00 am.- 12:00 p.m. — $ 3000 | s 3300 ¢ 2450 | § 2500 | § 8862 | § 3825 | § 100.00 | $ 1438 | § 7500 | § 60.00 | § 60.00 | § 60.00 | § 14219 | § 28650 | § 875.00
onday
. . 1 day per week
5 | Small Terminal Suite 201A 9:00 am. —5:00 p.m. — $ 3000 | s 3500 § 2450 | § 4500 | § 1734 3825 | § 55.00 | § 1438 | § 2500 | § 60.00 | § 4000 | § 4000 | § 10157 | § 9223 | $ 1,300.00
onday
y y 1 day per week
6 |T-Hangar Bathrooms (3) 9:00am. ~5:00pm. [ & B $ 3000 | s 3500 | § 7350 | § 2500 | § 3738 | § 3825 | § 55.00 | § 1438 | § 7500 | § 55.00 | § 60.00 | § 75.00 | § 12188 | § 12882 | § 1,300.00
inesday
TOTAL PRICE PER WEEK: | § 52521 $ 729.00 [ $ 75425 [ § 770.00 [ $ 827.06 | $ 866.25 | $ 870.00 | § 894.88 | § 955.00 | § $ 106000 [ § 1,135.00 | § 1,990.66 | § 332427 [$  11,555.00

201,720.00

Item Building Name Price Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
- Airport Terminal- Per Occurance s  80000|s 867.00 | § 37500 | $ 675.00 | § 800.00 | $ 650.00 No Bid $ 550,00 No Bid $ 175000 | $ 120000 [ $  1,200.00 | § 1695.00 | $ 245000 | § 3,000.00
Air Traffic Contol Tower Window Cleaning

T Building Name Occmance Ocovanee __Prce Per Occurance Price P Occurance gl IR ormanalil M oecatinca il I oznrancaltt] Mioceieangali I cesanaltl Ioccieana it I ol M ozeieanca it Ao ccinaice

8 Air Traffic Control Tower s 18000 s 463.00 | § 15000 | § 325.00 | § 20000 | $ 30000 No Bid $ 700,00 No Bid $ 48000 | § 60000 | $ 70000 | $ 675.00 | $ 27500 | $ 8,755.00
Floor Maintenance

Item Type of Floor / Maintenance Price (perSF)  Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (perSF)  Price (perSF)  Price (perSF)  Price (perSF) Price (perSF)  Price (perSF)  Price (per SF)  Price (perSF)  Price (perSF)  Price (perSF)  Price (per SF) Price (per SF)
9 [VCT - Stripping and Waxing/Buffing per Square foot $ 028 s 079 s 042 | 3 065 | 045 | s 075 |8 035 s 052 No Bid $ 096 | § 125 s 175 | § 079 s 045 | s 8.00
10 |Tile Ceramic - Deep Cleaning $ 037 s o7 | s 028§ 065 | 042 | s 050 [ $ 125 | $ 032 No Bid $ 060 [ $ 125 | $ 175 | $ 300 [ $ 035§ 3.00
11 |Polished Concrete — Deep Cleaning $ 042 s o7 | s 048 | $ 065 | $ 032 s 050 | 125 | § 025 No Bid $ 125 | § 125 | § 175 | § 899§ 0358 400
12 [LVT - Deep Cleaning $ 037 s o7 |s 028§ 065 | 022 050 [ $ 125 | $ 0.25 No Bid $ 060 [ $ 125 | $ 175 | $ 080 [ $ 035§ 500

Emergency Cleaning Services

13 2;;‘% for emergency cleaning services at any location covered under this $ 2000 | $ 25.00 | § 3200 § 2500 § 2800 | § 25.00 | § 75.00 | $ 3371 No Bid $ 65.00 | $ 10000 | § 7500 | § 6250 | § 2800 | $ 225.00
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